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hoping thereby to set a good example, but though he baptized some of the dying, the medicine men persisted in trying to assuage the pestilence 
by appeasing the manitous, especially that of the French who they thought had power over their own. Half of the village soon died.(see fn. 71)  

That the plague which raged among the Mascouten also ravaged the French can be assumed. The winter of 1702-1703, and the year 1704, saw 
epidemics of sickness both in Canada and Louisiana.(see fn. 72) In any case, Juchereau himself died in the autumn of 1703, his death sealing 
the doom of the establishment.(see fn. 73)  

Of the accomplishments at the post little is known. Some hunting had been done and several thousand buffalo skins had been collected. It is 
probable that some of these were tanned into leather. The Sieur de St. Lambert, who was second in command to Juchereau, reports that he 
started to remove the skins and leather down the river, but lost them through a rise in the water and by theft by the Indians.(see fn. 74) As for 
Juchereau's men, those  
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Massac," loc. cit., 43. Pénicaut says St. Lambert brought 12,000 skins to Mobile before Juchereau died. Margry, Découvertes et Etablissements,
V, 439. M. Fauteux mentions that 15,000 skins were abandoned at the post. Essai sur l'industrie au Canada, II, 417.  

  

who survived undoubtedly became coureurs de bois. Le Moyne Bienville in 1704 mentions that as many as 110 or 120 men were in that 
vicinity and that beaver pelts were being collected there. Some voyageurs had even asked for the right to take these furs to France for sale.(see 
fn. 75)  

At the time of Juchereau's death, accusations were being lodged against him to the effect that his activities on the Ohio were centered about the 
beaver trade rather than in the tannery business. The Company of Canada led in these accusations, charging that Juchereau had followed in Le 
Sueur's footsteps. They lamented the fact that employees of their own were constantly deserting "to join with this commerce."(see fn. 76) 
Bienville, it has been observed, admitted that voyageurs and coureurs de bois were operating in northern Louisiana in small bands.(see fn. 77) 
At Detroit it was charged that Juchereau and Pascaud had connived to trade throughout the West even "up to the neighborhood of Detroit."(see 
fn. 78) M. Sulte charges that Juchereau traded in collusion with Le Sueur, La Forest, Tonty, and Pascaud at Green Bay, operating through 
coureurs de bois centered at that post.(see fn. 79) It was also charged that Juchereau and his men hunted slaves among the southern Indians.(see 
fn. 80) The information at hand does not warrant these accusations. The death of Juchereau and the collapse of his establishment silenced his 
enemies, while the truth  

 
75Bienville to Minister, September 6, 1704, Arch. Nat., Col., C13A, 1:457-58.  

76Memoir concerning the control of affairs of the company, November 10, 1703, Arch. Nat., Col., C11A, 21:182. 

 

77Bienville to Minister, September 6, 1704, Arch. Nat., Col., C13A, 1:457. 

 

78The writer of the Memoir of 1703 says: "It is that which makes the public jealous, and causes all these escapades of licentious Canadians, 

who say bluntly that it is only the virtuous and the obedient who are victims to it. They are indeed, not altogether wrong in that; for it is 
grevious [sic] to them to see a few individuals skim the milk and take the pick of the wool of the country, through the licenses and permits 
given to them." "Report on Detroit in 1703, Michigan Pioneer and Historical Collections, XXXIII, 1904, p. 175.  

79Sulte, "Henry de Tonty," loc. cit., 27-28. See also Fauteux, Essai sur l'industrie au Canada, II, 416-17. 
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about his activities in the western country will probably forever remain buried with him. Even Thérèse Migeon seems to have been silent after 
the death of her husband.  

Juchereau's idea, however, lived on. The strategic importance of a post at the mouth of the Ohio was not to be ignored by the French 
throughout the rest of their control of the West. In the 1740's the construction of such a post was seriously considered and in 1757 Fort Massac 
arose as the successor to Juchereau's fort.(see fn. 81) Then, too, the commercial possibilities of that region tempted even the Jesuits to speculate 
upon the establishment of such a project as Juchereau had conceived.(see fn. 82) Somewhat later a proposal was brought forth which 
contemplated abandoning Detroit and moving some of the inhabitants from that post to the mouth of the Ohio, where the possibilities of trade 
in buffalo skins and of the development of mines seemed promising.(see fn. 83)  

So ended the career of Charles Juchereau de St. Denys. Though not a man of genius, he nevertheless remains a foremost member of that group 
of hardy Canadians who pioneered in the great work of opening up the western country to those who later came to inherit it. Juchereau was a 
man of vision. His attempt to develop a commercial enterprise that was not based upon the beaver trade or mining was unique, though 
premature. Like the majority of his colleagues he probably did not hesitate to disregard the red tape of governmental control which the French 
despotism sought to fasten upon the colonies. Perhaps, like La Salle, Juchereau's chief fault was that he staked all upon the success of his single 
project. Like La Salle he lost all in the attempt.  
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